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Editorial Review

Review

Each chapter of the book is a separate self-contained part. The length of each chapter is adequately selected,
while the balance between an introduction for beginners and details for advanced readers is excellently
preserved. For a majority of the covered topics, a comprehensive survey and thoughtful taxonomy are
provided. The presented issues are followed by the exemplary solutions, which are not only conceptual, but
very often describe practical deployments. Furthermore, the reference lists are complete, while indicated
directions for further studies are relevant and valuable.......Summarizing, I recommend this book as a source
of very relevant and valuable information about popular and emerging cloud-related topics. An additional
advantage is that security and energy efficiency are also addressed. - (IEEE Communication Magazine-
Nov 2016)

From the Back Cover

This book will help decision makers as they consider the migration of services to the Cloud and serve as a
reference tool for professionals in industry and academia

Cloud computing has changed the way information services are offered on the Internet, facilitating the
establishment of new businesses based on a pay-per-use acquisition of computing resources. Cloud Services,
Networking and Management provides a comprehensive overview of the cloud infrastructure and services, as
well as their underlying management mechanisms, including data center virtualization and networking, cloud
security and reliability, big data analytics, scientific and commercial applications.

Special features of the book include:

State-of-the-art content●

Self-contained chapters for readers with specific interests●

Includes commercial applications on Cloud (video services and games)●

Cloud Services, Networking, and Management includes up-to-date material on topics such as management
and scheduling, Big Data, energy efficient operation, and commercial applications, from their basic concepts
to recent advances and future research directions.

Nelson Fonseca is a Professor at the Institute of Computing of the State University of Campinas, Brazil.
He's received several conference best paper awards including the IEEE Globecom Best Paper Award, the
Medal of the Chancelor of the University of Pisa and the IEEE ComSoc Joseph LoCicero Award for
Exemplary Service to Publications. He is an editorial board member of several journals and has chaired and
created numerous IEEE conferences. He is former EiC of the IEEE Communications Surveys and
Tutorials.

Raouf Boutaba is a Professor of Computer Science at the University of Waterloo, Canada. He has
published extensively in the area of network and service management and received several journal and



conference Best Paper Awards such as the 2008 IEEE Fred W. Ellersnick Prize Paper Award as well as other
recognitions such as the Dan Stokesbury award and the McNaughton Gold Medal. He is a fellow of the IEEE
and the Engineering Institute of Canada.
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Users Review

From reader reviews:

William Vogt:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Cloud Services, Networking, and Management (IEEE
Press Series on Networks and Services Management). You can choose the best book if you appreciate
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Cloud Services, Networking, and
Management (IEEE Press Series on Networks and Services Management). You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize
everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or even searching by
internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Angela Powers:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This guide Cloud Services, Networking, and Management (IEEE Press Series on Networks
and Services Management) was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about
your technology competence. Some people has various feel when they reading some sort of book. If you
know how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like right now,
many ways to get book you wanted.

Randall Briggs:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Cloud Services, Networking, and Management
(IEEE Press Series on Networks and Services Management) was colorful and of course has pictures on the
website. As we know that book Cloud Services, Networking, and Management (IEEE Press Series on
Networks and Services Management) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teens. For example



Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book
in your case and try to like reading that.

Lavada Rowlett:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that
on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Cloud Services, Networking, and Management (IEEE Press Series on Networks and
Services Management) can make you experience more interested to read.
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