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"The first thing to realize about the study of color in our time is its uncanny
ability to evade all attempts to systematically codify it," writes Charles A. Riley
in this series of interconnected essays on the uses and meanings of color.
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Editorial Review

Review

“The subtitle clearly delineates the subject matter of this important book on the subjectivity of color sense
and theories thereof, from the late 19th century to the present . . . [Riley] stresses the relatively independent
development of color ideas among the theorists chosen, speaking of interrelations usually only where they
have some historical or conceptual validity; and he does so in a clear, intelligible style.” —Choice

“Riley's richly rewarding scholarly study explores the multiple meanings of color.” —Publishers Weekly

“In six intricate essays, the author discusses uses of color by the foremost contemporary artists, composers,
philosophers, authors, architects, and psychologists . . . Riley's impressively wide-ranging knowledge
demonstrate[s] the unique and varied perceptions in the field.”—Library Journal

Review
“A captivating book. Rich in information and graceful in its prose, I know of no other book on the subject
with this kind of encyclopedic breadth. The vast amount of detail is handled with an ease that belies the years
of research that must have gone into this project.” (Wendy Steiner, author of The Scandal of Pleasure)

“A tour de force . . . Color Codes is in a class by itself.” (C. L. Hardin, author of Color for Philosophers)

“In his wonderful book, Charles Riley makes color more graspable, more at hand than ever before. At the
same time he enhances, indeed, seems to fuel our appreciation of the excitement of color.” (Frank Stella,
artist and author of Working Space)

From the Publisher
6 x 9 trim. 8 color illus. LC 94-9733

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Justin Price:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice simply by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than other is high. In your
case who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color in
Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music, and Psychology book as starter and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.



Richard Tipton:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color in Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music,
and Psychology your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then
become one form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get before. The Color Codes: Modern
Theories of Color in Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music, and Psychology giving you
another experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful information for your better
life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased
when you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing
spare time activity?

Stephen Hawkins:

This Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color in Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music,
and Psychology is great guide for you because the content and that is full of information for you who also
always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it data accurately
using great coordinate word or we can point out no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it
hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tricky
core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color in
Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music, and Psychology in your hand like having the world
in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no guide that offer you world in ten or fifteen
moment right but this book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. busy do
you still doubt in which?

Judi Orta:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose often the book Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color
in Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature, Music, and Psychology to make your personal reading
is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose very
simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book and looking at
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open a book and go through it. Beside that the
publication Color Codes: Modern Theories of Color in Philosophy, Painting and Architecture, Literature,
Music, and Psychology can to be your new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in what must
you're doing of the time.
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